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Rowlands, Ceiri

From: Rowlands, Ceiri

Sent: 08 December 2020 15:34

To: 'Rhian Lees'

Subject: RE: Model Farm - Viability Report

Hi,

I understand this has been forwarded to L&G direct – so hopefully is now in hand.
Thanks,
Ceiri

From: Rhian Lees <Rhian.Lees@rpsgroup.com> 
Sent: 07 December 2020 14:11
To: Rowlands, Ceiri <cerowlands@valeofglamorgan.gov.uk>
Subject: RE: Model Farm - Viability Report

Ceiri

Can you send me a copy of the original invoice please – has it ever been sent to L&G?

Thanks

Rhian 

Rhian Lees

Associate
RPS | Consulting UK & Ireland 
T +44 2920 668 662
E rhian.lees@rpsgroup.com

From: Rowlands, Ceiri <cerowlands@valeofglamorgan.gov.uk> 
Sent: 09 July 2020 16:33
To: Rhian Lees <Rhian.Lees@rpsgroup.com>
Subject: Model Farm - Viability Report

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of RPS.

Hi,

Draft report attached. I’ve had an invoice through from Avison Young for the sum of £8000 + VAT. So, a total of 
£9,600. The sum is inclusive of any minor changes/ final drafting. We now need to invoice L&G for recovery – can 
you please confirm the details for doing so?

Regards,

Ceiri Rowlands
Assistant Planner / Cynllunydd Cynorthwyol
Planning and Transportation Services / Gwasanaethau Cynllunio a Thrafnidiaeth 
Vale of Glamorgan Council / Cyngor Bro Morgannwg
tel / ffôn: 01446 704654
mob / sym: 
e-mail / e-bost: cerowlands@valeofglamorgan.gov.uk
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The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been moved, renamed,  
or deleted. Verify that the link points to the correct file and location.

Consider the environment. Please don't print this e-mail unless you really need to.
Ystyriwch yr amgylchedd. Peidiwch ag argraffu'r neges hon oni bai fod gwir angen.

Visit our Website at www.valeofglamorgan.gov.uk
Ewch i'n gwefan yn www.bromorgannwg.gov.uk

Find us on Facebook / Cewch ddod o hyd i ni ar Facebook
Follow us on Twitter / Dilynwch ni ar Twitter

Correspondence is welcomed in Welsh or English / Croesewir Gohebiaeth yn y Gymraeg neu yn Saesneg.

This e-mail message and any attached file is the property of the sender and is sent in confidence to the addressee only.

Internet communications are not secure and RPS is not responsible for their abuse by third parties, any alteration or corruption in transmission or for any loss 
or damage caused by a virus or by any other means.

RPS Group Plc, company number: 208 7786 (England). Registered office: 20 Western Avenue Milton Park Abingdon Oxfordshire OX14 4SH.

RPS Group Plc web link: http://www.rpsgroup.com


